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900 Students Receive Honors Sunday 
Eastern has honored more 

than flOO of its students for 
scholastic and leadership 
abilities. 

In the recent Honors Day 
Program, awards were 
presented by It academic 
departments and 10 campus 
organizations. Most of these 
awards are traditional and 
presented each year. 

Those winning recognition 
included the 531 students on the 
Dean's List for academic ex- 
cellence, the St in "Who's Who 
Among Students in American 
Universities and Collages," and 
those winning scholarships, 
assistantships, and honor 
society swards. 

The Dean's List recognition 
was given by Dr. Thomas 
Stovall, vice president for 
academic affairs. Dr. Thomas 
Myers, vice president for 
rtudent affairs, recognized the 
members   of   Who's   Who. 

Recognition of honor societies 
was made by Miss Mary 
Katherine Ignels, dean of 
women. Hayward Daugherty, 
director of student activities, 
presented organisations! 
awards. 

The department presen- 
tations were made by academic 
and administrative deans. 

The students who received 
departmental and 
organizational awards are: 

Department of Agriculture: 
The Ag-Tech Book Award, Rick 
Bee, Bethel, Ohio; Department 
of Home economics: Mary K. 
Burrier Award, Susan Steger 
Poaton, Burlington; Charles F. 
Weaver Award, Karen Latimer, 
Williamstown, Kentucky; 
Department of Industrial 
Education: Noble G. Deniston 
Award, Fred Gehron, Rich- 
mond ; Department of Nursing: 
Outstanding Nursing Student 
Award, Vickl Patterson, 
Burgin. 

Department of Art: Award in 
Painting, Sarah Cobb, Ft. 
Mitchell; Award in Art 
Education, Michael Parks, 
Richmond; Department of 
Biology: Outstanding Biology 
Students, Freshman Award, 
Sharlalee Borst, Ashland; 
Sophomore Award, Richard 
Fury, Harrison, Ohio; Junior 
Award, Billy Taylor, Rich- 
mond; Senior Award, Glenda 
Bryant, Liberty. 

Department Of Chemistry 

Department of Chemistry: 
Outstanding Chemistry 
Students, CRC Freshman 
Chemistry Achievement 
Award, Pamela Hoskins, 
Cincinnati; Outstanding 
Sophomore Chemist Award, 
John Compton, Pikeville; 
Outstanding Junior Chemist 
Award, Martha McKenzie, Flat 
Gap.   . 

Department of Drama and 
Speech:     Pearl    Buchanan 

Achievement Award, 
Hasekoester, Southgate; Keene 

Oratory Contest Winner, 
Carolyn Reppard, Mt. Version; 
Weaver Oratory Contest 
Winner, Tichard Toss, Van 
dalia; Novice Debater Award, 
Harold Greene, Lexington, 
Varsity Debater Award, Maty 
Ann Ferrante, Cambelltaviaw; 
Department of English1: 
Presley M. Grise Award for 
Poetry, To Be announced, Roy 
B. Clark Award for Short 
Fiction, To Be Announced, 
Highest Academic Average in 
English-Sponsored by Sigma 
Tau Delta, Kitty Dyehouse, 
Lancaster. 

Department of Foreign 
Language: Ruasian Award, 
Karen Schuler, Louisville; 
Spanish Awards, Carlos 
Badessich, Argentina; Susan 
Niehoff, Louisville; German 
Award, Wanda Wright, 
Lexington. 

Department of Geology: 
Outstanding Geology Student 
Award, George T. Slone, Requa, 
Ohio; Department of History: 
Outstanding Social Science 
Area Award, Paul Sheppard 
Stansbury, Fern Creek; Out- 
standing History Student 
Award, Paula Gale Johnson, 
Louisville; Kerney M. Adams 
History Scholar, 1972-1173, 
David Malcom Jones, Rich- 
mond ; Department of 
Mathematics Award: Fresh- 
man Mathematics Award, 
Sydney Behymer, Hlllsboro, 
Ohio. Outstanding Student in 
Physics, David Smith. 

Department of Physics: 
Outstanding Students in 
Elementary Physics, Peggy 
Yao, Hong Kong; Outstanding 
Graduating Senior in Physics, 
George Halsey, Richmond; 
Outstanding Pre-Engineering 
Freshman, Thomas G. 
Thompson, Frankfort Depart- 
ment   of   Political    Scince: 

Outstnaind Political Science 
Students, Steven D. Gold, 
Henderson; Thomas L. Tarvin, 
Brookville, Indiana; Depart- 
ment of Psychology: Clark L. 
Hull Award of Excellence, 
Connie Cundiff, Liberty. 

Department Of Mask 

Depsrtment of Music: 
Achievement in Strings Award, 
Buddy Rhodes, Richmond, 
Achievement in Woodwind 
Award, Mary Helen Moorhead, 
Versailles, Indians; 
Achievement in Voice Award, 
Lisa Davis, SSeymour, Indians; 
Achievement in Keyboard 
Award, Fumihiko Yagi, Tokyo; 
Achievement in Brass Winds 
Award, John Drew, Lexington; 
Irene S. Muir Scholarship 
Award, Rebecca Hay wood, 
Prestonsburg; and Janice 
Henrich, West Chester, Ohio. 

Department of Business 
Education: NBEA Professional 

.Award, Linda Gayle Medley, 

Springfield, Department of 
Military Science, Recipients of 
Two-Year Scholarships, 
William L. Hughes, Irvine; Purl 
K. Keen, Sycamore, 111.; 
Raymond K. Landrum, 
Winamac, Indiana; John R. 
Lanier, London, Ky.; 
Recipients of Three-year 
Scholarships: Kenneth W. 
Hackworth, Berea; Ricky A. 
Haggard, Winchester; Donald 
R. Leathers, Frankfort; Jeffrey 
S. Magers, Louisville; Gregory 
H. Moore, Miamisburg, Ohio; 
Stanford T. Mullen, Jr., 
Louisville; David S. Neal, Pine 
Knot; Michael W. Pratt, 
Georgetown; Robert E. Reed, 
Ft. Thomas; Recipient of Three 
and die-half year Scholarship, 
Robert J. Bertrand, Jr., Ft. 
Knox; Army ROTC Fellowship, 
Peter. R. Dawkins, Louisville. 

Department of Education, 
Gladys P. Tyng Award, Mary 
Arnold Davis, Lancaster; 
Department     of      Library. 

Science:Achievement in the 
field of Library Scince, Hilda, 
Annelle Wall, Waynesburg; 
Division of Health, Physical 
Education, Recreation and 
Athletics, Outstanding senior 
MWoman Major in Physical 
Education, Cheryl Miller, 
Gratis, 0 ; Outstanding Senior 
Man Major in Physical 
Education, John D. James, 
Richmond; Outstanding Con- 
tribution to his Profession in the 
Department of Physical 
Education for Men, Ronald J. 
Holihan, Camillas, N.Y.; 
Outstanding Senior Leadership 
and Academic Excellence in 
Recreation Award, Deborah M. 
Amatulli, Dayton, O.; Out- 
standing Sr. Leadership * 
Professional Involvement in 
Recreation Award, Janice A. 
Rogan, bardstown. 

Caducous Club: Meredith J. 
Cox Award for Outstanding 
Freshman-Sophomore      Mem- 
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SI 7 Million Nekt Year 

Regents Approve 1972-73 Budget. 

In Concert 
PnOtO iMMMIIlttMl 

Henry Mancini, winner of 20 Grammy Awards, 
six Golden Album Awards and 13 Academy 
Award nominations, will appear in concert with a 

38-piece orchestra, Monday, May 5, at 8 p.m. in 
Alumni Coliseum. Tickets are $2 in advance for 
students with I.D. cards and $5 at the door. 

Eastern's Board of 
Tuesday adopted a g< 
fund budget of $17,858,1 
the fiscal year beginning July 1. 

The projected general fund la 
an Increase of $819,807 over the 
revenue projected for the 
current fiscal year. This is 
approximately $390,000 less 
than the increase of the current 
year's budget over Fiscal 71. 

A state appropriation of 
$14,833,830, or an increase of 
»l,36l,30Joverth«ourrentyearT 
was included in the budget. Of 
the'increase, $981,741 was 
alloted to replace student 
registration fees for new debt 
service, leaving $399,581 
available for increase in 
current fund expenditures. 

In addition, the University 
has been allotted $183,550 from 
the "enrollment growth" fund 
established by the 1972 General 
Assembly. 

In other action the Board 
adopted the student fee 
schedule approved for Ken- 
tucky's regional universities by 
the Council on Public Higher 
Education April 11. Fees for in- 

Milestones Are Available May 1 
The 1973 Milestone is 

scheduled for distribution 
beginning 1 p.m. Monday at 
Alumni Coliseum. 

Distribution will be made 
from the front doors of the 
auxiliary gymnasium. Signs 
will indicate alphabetical lines 
for distribution. 

Beginning Tuesday, 
distribution will be made from 
the concession stands on the 
main concourse of the 
Coliseum. 

Milestone business manager 
Bob Hambly has announced the 
following distribution schedule: 

Monday. May 1 
19 a.m. to6p.m 

Tuesday, May 2 
10a.m. to 0 p.m. 

Wednesday. May 3 
10a.m. to6p.m. 

After      Wednesday, 
distribution will be moved to the 
Jones  Building,  third  floor 
conference room. 

The 1973 Milestone will be 
issued to all students who have 
paid the full fees both the fall 
and spring semesters and to 
others who have paid Milestone 
fees totaling $7.50. 

Hambly cautioned students 
who were not enrolled the fall 
semester that unless they paid 
aa additional $3.79 fee after 
spring registration they have 
paid only one-half the fee and 
are not entitled to a book. 
Payment of this balance msy 
still be made, through next 
weak only, at the Cashier's 
Window, Coatas Administration 
Building. These students should 
bring their receipt with them 
whan cttiming their book. 

Distribution    to     faculty 

members who have paid the 
$7.50 fee will be made only at 
the Jones Building, third floor. 

About 90 copies of the '72 
Milestone are still available for 
purchase. They may be bought, 
on a first-come basis, at the 
Cashier's Window. . 

Hambly stressed the im- 
portance of students observing 
the following procedures of 
distribution, since long lines are 
expected. 

1. Each student who has paid 
the full fees both semesters, or 
Milestone fees totaling $7.90 
must claim his own book. 

1 Each student must present 
his validated ID card at the 
designated distribution   point. 

There, will be eight 
alphabetical points designated 
signs. 

3. During regular distribution 
only one book will be issued to 
an individual The only ex- 
ceptions to be made are that 
friends may pick up books for 
students who are off campus 
doing student teaching and that 
students msy pick up their 
spouse's yearbook, if they are 
entitled to a book. In all cases, 
the student's I.D. card will be 
required and books will be 
distributed only from the proper 
alphabetical line. 

Protective plastic covers will 
be on sale at 29 cents each at the 
distribution points. 

Editor Paula McCann told 
The Progress that the 616-page 
Milestone will feature some 
organizational changes and 
other features that she hopes 
will improve the readability of 
the book for the students. She 

said that the same high quality 
paper stock that the 1971 
volume initiated is being con- 
tinued, as is the silk bookmark 
begun last year. 

Miss McCann said the book 
would feature a cover that 
would be the first of its type for 
a Milestone but she refused to 
elaborate. 

Student Senate Wraps Up 
Business For 71-72 Year 

1972-73 
Applications 
Are Available 

..Progress Editorial ap- 
plications will be available 
today at 3:38 p.m. in the Jones 
BeMkag. Roam 417. 

BY MSA COLLINS      „ 
SUH Writer       » 

At the closing of the last 
Student Senate meeting of the 
year. Student Association 
President Chuck Kelhoffer 
thanked all the senate members 
for their co-operation and called 
the 71-73 Senate the best group 
he had ever worked with in his 
life "We've had our ups and 
downs," said President 
Kelhoffer, "but that's what it's 
all about. I feel very privileged 
to have this position next year 
and I appreciate what you have 
all done." 

Thef Student Senate went on 
record as being in favor of open 
hours for all women, and en- 
dorsed the actions of the 
students at the Board of 
Regents meeting Tuesday. 

Hurbert Hagan presented the 
Film Committee Report which 
was the result of s survey taken 
several weeks ago. According to 
Hagan. most students like s 
combination   of   movies   that 

include drama, mystery and 
suspense. 80 per cent of the 
responses favored changing the 
movie starting time from 7:30 
p.m. to 8:30 p.m. as to allow 
students with night classes to 
attend. 

Also favored were double 
features on Friday and 
Saturday nights and a Sunday 
matinee. Hagan said that the 
movie currently running, "Play 
Misty For Me" is a result of the 
survey. 

The Senate proposed that the 
administration drop all "fines" 
charged for open hours. "When 
UK quit having hours for 
women, their dorm fees did not 
go up," said Lee Edgington, 
who proposed the motion. 

In a proposal suggested by 
Steve Slade, the ombudsman 
will be requested to attend all 
future Student Senate meetings 
and act as co-sponsor of the 
Senate. This will enable the 
ombudsman to "listen to the 
Senate and  take  proper   ad- 

(OasMsMsei M Fage B%M> 

state undergraduate students 
will be increased annually by 
$60, or $30 more per semester, 
for each of the next two years. 
Undergraduate registration 
fees for the 1973-73 year will be 
$80 per semester and $310 per 
semester for the 1973-74 year. 

The fee increases will not 
become effective until the fall 
1972 semester even though the 
Council authorized their im- 
plementation for the 1972 
summer session and in- 
tersession. 

IJegrees Approved 

Honorary degrees were ap- 
proved for Congresswoman 
Edith Green, Oregon, Dr. 
Robert Worthington, assistant 
commissioner of education in 
the office of education of the 
Department of Health, 
Education and Welfare, and to 
Allan W. Ostar, executive 
director of the American 
Association of State Colleges 
and Universities. 

Worthington and Ostar will 
receive their degrees at the 
spring snd summer com- 
mencement exercises, 
respectively. No date has been 
set for the presentation of 
Representative Green's. 

Regents Robert B. Begley, 
Richmond, and William L. 
Wallace, Lexington, who were 
recently reappointed by 
Governor Wendell Ford, were 
sworn in for their new terms. 

Presenting the budget to the 
Board, EKU President Robert 
R. Martin said that the 
recommended expenditures 
provide for continuation of 
current programs of the 
University. Salary increment 
for faculty and staff were in- 
cluded to meet the increase in 
the cost of living and to achieve 
equity. 

Dr. Martin pointed out that 
salary levels for clerical and 
hourly employees of the 
University were raised to 
establish a $2.00 hourly 
minimum. 

Fund Expenditures 

Major* general fund ex- 
penditures, with percentages of 
the total included: Instruction 
snd depsrtmentsl research, 
$9,238,939 (91.7 per cent); 
operation and maintenance of 
physical plant, $2,739,945 (15.3 
per cent); general institutional 
services and expenses, 
$1,018,795 (15.7 per cent) snd 
library services, $960,800 (4.8 
par cent). General University 

administration was budgeted at 
$494,008,3.6 per cent of the total 
estimated expenditures. 

The Board also approved for 
1972-73 a current restricted fund 
of $2,753,690 and a retirement of 
bonded indebtedness fund of 
$8,481,175. 

Estimated revenues were 
based on the new student fee 
schedule, the state ap- 
propriation and historical 
projections of other current 
revenues. It was estimated that 
the current year enrollment 
levels would be maintained and 
the 15 per cent of the enrollment 
would be by non-resident 
students. 

Several aspects of student 
dormitory living were discussed 
at the meeting. The Board was 
presented with copies of all 
University policies and ad- 
ministrative procedures con- 
cerning dormitories for their 
review. 

Self-Regulated Hours 

It hesrd statements con- 
cerning self-regulated hours for 
women and the possible im- 
plimenutioa of a system of 
open-visitation in Eastern 
dorms from Chuck Kelhoffer, 
Student Association President, 
and Sharon  Crews,  Women's 

Interdormltory Council 
President. 

The discussion centered 
around the possibilities of ex- 
tending self-regulated hours to 
include more women students 
and to bring men under the 
system. Security of the dor- 
mitories was the chief point of 
consideration. 

Currently women graduate 
students, married women, and 
coeds over die sge of 21 have the 
option to elect self-regulated 
dorms. Women under 21, and 
those with more than 24 
semester   hours,   must   have 
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Students marched and carried signs such as this 
Tuesday afternoon before they staged a "si -in" 
outside the Board of Regents Meeting -. The 
students,   represented   by   Chuck   Kelhoffer, 

Photo By Jiarsh««*«rd 

Sharon Crews and Delight Voignier, demanded a 
ruling on open hours and open visitation in 
dormitories. 

Demonstrators Disappointed 

. . .Take No Action On Hours 

No Checks Cashed 

After     Tomorrow 
In oroer to close out alf 

financial transactions before 
the end of the semester, per- 
sonal checks will not be cashed 
sfter April 29, 1972. Each 
student should plan his financial 
needs accordingly. 

BY BETSEY BELL 
Academics Editor 

Approximately 200 students, 
supporting changes in women's 
dormitory policies marched 
across campus to thr Ad- 
ministration Building where a 
"sit-in" was staged outside the 
Board of Regents meeting 
where proposals for changes 
were being discussed. 

Chuck Kelhoffer, Sharon 
Crews and Delight Voignier, 
spokesmen for the students told 
the regents that they wanted 
curfews removed for all women 
and s specific policy for open 
dorm visitations for all 
students.   Kelhoffer,   conveyed 

totheregents a.survey in which 
1,252 of 1,830 students voted in 
favor of a 24-hour visitation 
policy. 

However he told regents that 
such a liberal policy was 
unrealistic am] suggested that 
visitation hours be set from 7 
p.m. to 4 a.m. Fridays and 
Saturdays. 

Presently curfew is set for 
women with less than 24 
semester hours which includes 
most freshmen. With parental 
consent 1000 women can have 
self-regulated hours by paying 
an additional $15 semester fee 
to cover the cost of security. 

After a two hour discussion 
the Board of Regents decided to 
postpone voting on the proposal 

under the recomendation from 
President Robert Martin that he 
and other administration of- 
ficials review the questions 
further with the students and 
prepare specific proposals. . 

Martin told the regents that 
only one third of the dormitory 
residents voted on Kelhoffer's 
survey concerning open 
visitation, indicating that 
student interest in open 
visitation was less than what 
was indicated by the survey. 

Shsron Crews urged the 
regents to remove the parental 
consent requirement for women 
to have self-regulated hours. 
However    she suggested  ex 
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Give Them 'Libery' \ 

Students   'Sit-In' On Board Meeting 
Armed with misspelled placards and 

a handful.of yellow armbands, a couple 
of hundred students who said they were 
concerned with women's hours and open 
visitation, marched peacefully across 
campus Tuesday afternoon and staged a 
sit-in. stand-in, or a something-in on the 
main floor of the Administration 
Building. 

Eastern's Board of Regents were to 
have acted on the two issues, among 
other things. Proposals submitted by 
Student Association President Chuck 
Kelhoffer and Student Regent Guy 
Hatfield, calling for abolishment of 
women's hours and establishment of 
some sort of dormitory intervisitation 
rules. 

The "other things" on the Regents' 
agenda were apparently relatively 
unimportant to the assemblage, 
because by the time the Board took a 
short recess at 4:00 p.m., there were 
less than 100 "protestors" left in the 
corridors. 

A trivial matter of the University's $17 
million-plus budget somehow managed 
to take precedence over the students' 
demands, as did a couple of allotments 
from a state appropriations committee 
and the Kentucky General Assembly. 

The demonstration, itself, was quite 
well planned, and everything went 
smoothly-for about half an hour. One 
by one, the sitters' complacency was 
replaced by restlessness, and the group 
got progressively noiser as the af- 
ternoon wore on. By three o'clock, the 
hall looked like an intermission at the 
campus flick. 

There was some friendly horseplay to 
relieve tensions, and there were several 
rap sessions in which the topic was not 
the liberation of the oppressed female 
on campus. 

Aluminum soft drink cans pinged* 
periodically and the floor soon was 
decorated in Early R.J. Reynolds. The 
students with the yellow armbands 
monitored the area in between short pep 
talks aimed at keeping the group 
around. 

Feiffer 

By the end of-the siege, however, the 
floor was almost as clean as the 
students had found it, thanks again to 
the yellow armband patrol. 

A quick look around the building 
caused concern for the EKU women-not 
over whether or not they should be 
permitted to stay out all night, but 
whether Or not a couple of them had been 
to grammar school. After staying out all 
night, maybe it is tough to spell words 
like "liberty" (libery) and 
"discriminate'' (discrimate) both of 
which contain more than one syllable. 

Not satisfied with the action taken by 
the Regents, many of the protestors 
ambled toward the ravine to "camp 
out" for the night. 

About 50 persons braved the sub- 
freezing weather to boycott the warmth 
of a dormitory room. 

Paul Lanter, a sophomore from 
Williamsburg, and spokesman for 
Eastern's Civil Liberties Association, 
said yesterday that a suit would 
definitely be filed by the Kentucky Civil 
Liberties Union against EKU and the 
Board of Regents on the grounds of sex 
discrimination. 

Lanter said that IS similar cases had 
been brought by the CLU and taken to 
the Supreme Court. He added that the 
Union had never lost one of these cases. 

Eastern  President  Dr.   Robert R. 
Martin said he knew of no cases ever 
being won on those grounds. He also 
said that if a suit were filed, the 
University is prepared to defend itself. 

Lanter also toad the Progress in an 
interview last week that according to his 
organization's constitution, the CLA's 
purpose is "to maintain throughout the 
Eastern Kentucky University campus 
the rights of free speech, free press, 
assemblage, and other civil rights as 

Letter Merits 

Immediate Answer 
Once in a while a letter is submitted 

for consideration which requires an 
immediate answer. For this reason we 
feel compelled to answer the criticism 
offered by David Siereveld. 

The picture page, April 20th issue 
served a dual purpose in that it offered 
the reader both an attractive and 
newsworthy pictures. Due to this ex- 
ceptionally strong picture the appeal of 
the page was greatly enhanced-. 

outlined by the American Civil Liberties 
Union and to take all legitimate actions 
in the futherance of such purposes." 

According to the constitution, then, 
the demonstration was all perfectly 
"legal." And the only thing worse than a 
legal demonstration is an unsuccessfull 
legal demonstration. 

VICTOR* Pardon me, But Aren't You Out 
A Little Late Young Lady??? 

Write On ! 
Progress Mistake 

Dear Editor, 
I muft congratulate The Pregre.. in reaching an 

all time low in journalistic excellence in the last 
edition. The first example of alipahod practices 
was in an omission in the ■MBal ad that was 
printed for Pizza Hut. This^istake coat the 
atudenU who tried to use ttfreoupons and the 
Pizza Hut management considerable in- 
convenience. Yet, this can easily be forgiven; 
mistakes do happen. 

There were, however, other examples of poor 
technique which I fed cannot be forgiven. I am 
referring to several photos which appeared in the 
paper. One was the 7" X •" aerial photo of the 
campus appearing on the front page. It was totally 
irrelevant, and a similar one has appeared In 
countless past issues. Why not show an aerial 
photo of the inside of a classroom? At least it 
would be something different for s change. 
Another blatant example of poor Judgement was 
the entire page of photos on page nine. Of all 
things, why another aerial photograph of campus? 
The other photos were something different, but 
they could've been compressed in half the space or 

Vote Saturday 

Letters far peblicatlea sbaeM iM typewrtttee/ 
denhie .paced, and net more than zss words long. 
All letters mast be signed and no aames will be 
withheld from print. The editor reserves the right 
to edit all letters providing the meaaiag will net be 
altered. Letters which may .abject the Progress 
snd-er the writer to libel will be returned for 
rewriting or withdrawal. 

Money Appreciated 

The "triteness" sward has to go to the •" X 7%" 
photo of President Martin's birdbouse on page ten, 
though. Who cares if it has just been revamped 
and will reside in "Dr. Martin's flower garden?" 
You may win a spot in some bird's heart, but birds 
don't read newspapers. 

I feel that these photos reflect poor judgement 
on the editor's parts as to what is news. There are 
many more newsworthy events about which to 
report on this campus. I suggest that you dig a 
little deeper than the bird guano in the future. 

David Siereveld 
Commonwealth Hall 

Dear Editor: 
This Saturday, at the various County Cour- 

thouses at 2:00 p.m. the Democratic Party win 
elect delegates to the State Convention on June 3 
and 3. For all practical purposes, this is the day 
that Kentucky's 47 delegates to the Miami Con- 
vention will be selected. If you are a registered 
Democrat, PLEASE go home this weekend and 
participate. 

We need you-on Saturday, at 3:00, at the 
Courthouse where you're registered. 

This is our last chance to change directions for 
four years. If you think we ought to change, please 
get out and help for just one hour this weekend. 
Your vote counts more this time than at any other 
time. 

Sincerely, 
John Lackey, Fifth District 

. Coordination for McGovern 

Morals Need Examination 

Dear Editor, 
In your issue of April 20th there was a well 

written article on the "Operation Venus" 
program which was initiated in Fayette County to 
combat the venereal disease problem. There is 
litUe doubt in my mind that the program serves to 
reduce the danger of VD. However, what troubles 
me is that the program fails to get at the heart of 
the problem. What I am referring to is the level of 
morality which exists in our country today. The 
value of marriage and family which are bask to 
our way of life continue to be at an all time low. If 
the morals of our country were upgraded, and if so 
many of oar elders would stop living under a 
"double standard," then the problem of VD would 
cease to exist. 

Ed Norton 

Dear Editor: 
Many campus organizations take it upon 

themselves to perform community service 
projects as part of campus-community in- 
volvement. The Association of Law Enforcement 
undertook such a project, but one that affects 
more than just the local community. Our 
organization was privileged to conduct the 
campus drive for the American Cancer Society. 

The American Cancer Society is continually 
searching for the causes and cures of cancer. This 
vital research is dependent upon the dollars 
provided by the millions of conscientious 
Americans across the country. Members of the 
university community demonstrated their support 
for this vital effort by contributing $681.06 to the 
cancer fund. This sum may appear small, but is 
when this amount is sdded to similar contributions 
from collecting agencies across the country that 
the full benefits will be realized. 

It would be impossible to recognise the many 
individuals and groups who made this drive such a 
success. An effort such as this is not the result of 
the work of one or two persons, but is the final 
product of the concerted effort of many respon- 
sible individuals. 

On behalf of the Association of Law En- 
forcement, as well. as the American Cancer 
Society, we would like to express our appreciation 
to those persons who found it within their means to 
donate to this cause 

Sincerely, 
Donald R. Filer, President 

Association of Law Enforcement 
Steven E. Morrow, Chairman 

Campus Cancer Drive 
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'Peanuts' Comes To Life 
•/ 

In Drama Production 
By Pat Dotson 

Lucy, Linus, Snoopy, and the entire 
"Peanuts" gang came to life last week, 
as the EKU Drama Dept. presented its 
final production of the year "You're A 
Good Man, Charlie Brown','based on the 
popular Charles Shultz comic Strip. 

As a popular show for many years off - 
Broadway, this is now the stage's 
second-longest running show-topped 
only by the "Fantasticks," which has 
now run for several years. 

The audience was lively, but small, as 
many parents brought their children to 
see this family-type production. This 
was perhaps a fitting farewell to drector 
Dr. Haller T. Laughlin who is leaving 
Eastern, having enjoyed several 
previous box office successes. 

"You're A Good Man, Charlie Brown" 
is a series of short sketches, in- 
terspersed with several song and dance 
routines, similar to the "Laugh-In" 
style of production. In doing this, the 
snow kept the pace moving, but 
prevented any real depth of charac- 
terization, or audience association from 
evolving. 

The show was a typical Laughlin 
production; well-polished, well-acted 
and with a cast obviously enjoying their 
roles. 

The plot centers around average 
moments in the lives of Charlie Brown, 
and his "All-American" friends. But it 
was here that many of the actors had 
difficulty, it seemed in convincing us 
that they were indeed Children. Often, 
more effort appeared to go into the 
acting likt children, rather than the 
being of children. 

Merle Middleton, as Charlie Brown, 
was a welcome exception. His poignant 
facial expressions and unmistakeable 
"stage presence" caught up ' the 
audience in Charlie Brown's unique 
world. 

Toni Trimble, as Lucy, was exciting 
and vibrant. She is gifted with a fine 
strong voice, but why, Miss Trimble, 
must you yell so continuously that you 
lose your effect? Lucy l« a loudmouth, 
and she would yell at times, but she 
should have our empathy. 

Fortunately we did not always feel this 
communion with the character. 
Because of her natural vitality and 
energy, Miss Trimble often dominated 
her peers in many scenes, and too-of ten 
carried the show. 

Bobby Butler wot Snoopy. Though not 
possessed with a strong voice, he did a 
very creditable job in a challenging 
role. He was appropriatly funny, and his 
"bark" was quite humorous. Butler also 
managed his songs well through much 
energy and characterization. 

Danny Browning, as Linus, came 
through with his finest performance to 
date. He has a fine voice, but why does it 
sound so much like Dean Martin in the 
song "My Blanket and Me?" 

H.R.Giles, as Schroeder, in his first 
major acting role, was a creditable asset 
to the play. He had perhaps the best 
male singing voice on stage, and 
although his characterization was 
sometimes inconsistent, he performed 
well. 

In minor roles, Cathy Hornsby as 
Sally, and Bob Gray as Pigpen were 
most convincing as children. 
Believable .- in character, and 
tremendously funny throughout, they- 
most of all-won their audience. 

Lisa Baldwin, as the Little Red- 
Headed girl, was cute, but perhaps 
more could have been done to enhance 
the facial expressions of such a vivid 
character, 
i 

If indeed any bit of slight miscasting 
did occur, it was because Kathy Paris- 
physically at least-was not Frieda. 

Mary Kay Portune, Carol Cole, Rick 
Diehl, Mike Woods, Gary Lawrence, 
and Vicki Wolfe provided an adequate 
supporting cast. The songs were 
pleasant, but few were really 
"memorable" or "outstanding." 

Costumes, under the direction of 
Professor Joan Richman, were as usual, 
exceptional. Professor Robinson's set 
was both functional, and attractive. It 
consisted of a series of geometric blocks 
in various colors, which the cast moved 
about.'"You're A Good Man, Charlie 
Brown," up in lights about the stage, 
pointedly reminds us of the same effect 
used in a previous production. 

An enjoyable evening for the family, 
and a successful final production for the 
Drama Dept.; this was "Charlie 
Brown." This too, was the final curtain 
for many EKU seniors who have 
provided us with many pleasant 
memories in their four years. 

And to you, Dr. Laughlin, a fitting 
farewell. We have enjoyed and ap- 
preciated your work at Eastern. This 
production was no exception. Thank 
you. Performances continue through 
Saturday evening. 

e 
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Second Time Around 
Yesterday, Dr. Robert R Martin was the first recipient  of the University 
Ensemble's Second Album, entitled "In The Beginning." Phillip Uwery; 

Ruble Caldwell, newly elected president of the Ensemble; and Phillip 
Brown, outgoing president, are pictured making the presentation. 

How To Make A Killing 

NO STRONG 

Record Sale 
<Rock Classics Soul \ 

Folk Jazz Opera / 

4t 
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TUESDAY'S   WINNER 

SUE RITTER 

WHO WILL BE TODAYS ? 

WALLACE'S 
BOOK STORE 
292 South Second Street 

DOWNTOWN 
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Transcendental Meditation 

Concept Grows On Campus 
HY PAULA GOODIN 

Feature Kditor 

"To Maharishi Mahesh Yogi, 
who seeks to uplift the human 
spirit and combat despair in our 
troubled world," reads the 
inscription on the Man of Hope 
Award for 1970. 

The Maharishi received the 
award for his efforts to help 
man through Transcendental 
Meditation. 

Rick Hill, Kentucky's coor- 
dinator for Student's In- 
ternational Meditation Society 
(SIMS), said that Meditation 
has "been a breakthrough in 
physiology equivalent to Ein- 
stein's theory of relativity. It is 
the ability of virtually anyone to 
induce in his body a deep state 
of rest. This roots away the 

P deep-rooted stresses that 
everybody has." 

Hill conducted an in- 
troductory lecture on 
Meditation last night in 
Combs Building. The lecture 
included a short film 
featuring the Maharishi and 
others discussing Meditation. It 
also included several     slides 

 on   the   scientific   effects   of 
Transcendental Meditation. 

A later lecture scheduled for 
May 2 will go into more detail 
about Meditation and is 
required if a person plans to 
take the course. The course will 

be taught from May 6 through 
May 9. 

Hill said that one requirement 
of the course is that an in- 

.dividual "be free of the in- 
fluence of so-called recreational 
chemicals including marijuana 
and other mind altering drugs 
for at least IS days prior to the 
first day of the course. 

"While Transcendental 
Meditation is a verjf simple, 
natural, spontaneous process 
like waking, dreaming, or deep 
sleep, it is built upon a thorough 
understanding of all disciplines, 
and currently a university of 
international scope has been 
designed to grant doctorate, 
masters, and bachelor degrees 
in the Science of Creative In- 
telligence," said Hill. 

The curriculum will 
relate each discipline to some 
stable field and includes 
numerous courses such as 
psychology of the integrated 
individual, genetics, education, 
the source of thought, and the 
source of literature. 

Hill, a 1967 Centre College 
graduate, said that the 
traditional approach to 
education has created 
"fragmented knowledge and a 
lack of ffulfillment. So the 
purpose of SCI is to provide a 
thorough understanding of the 
arts and humanities in terms of 
how they are all expressions of 

that   basic  field   of  Creative 
intelligence, and to produce a 
fulfilled, functioning citizen for 
the society." 

Right now a program known 
as the World Plan is being 
perlected by which  the world 
can quickly be taught Tran- 
scendental Meditation. 350 
centers are planned to produce 
teachers of Meditation in six 
month courses that will be 
taught on weekends and in the 
evenings so students and 
working people can take ad- 
vantage of it. The centers are to 
be set up per every population 
of 10 million people by June 15. 

Hill said that they ap- 
proximate that 1000 people will 
enroll in each center. If so they 
will have 350,000 qualified 
teachers by the end of this year 
when they plan to set up more 
centers-one per every one 
million population in the world. 
By the end of 1973 they expect to 
have almost four million 
teachers-quite an increase over 
from 2,000 teachers presently in 
the world. 

In Kentucky Transcendental 
Meditation is currently taught 
in cooperation with drug 
education programs, the army 
posts, department of mental 
health, and comprehensiveVare 
centers. 

Anyone who would like more 
information on Meditation can 
write or call: Rick Hill, SIMS, 
320 Linden Walk, Lexington. 
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FREE 
THIS COUPON ENTITIES YOU TO 1 (ONE) 

GALLON OF GASOLINE WHEN YOU PURCHASE 
$1.00 or more OF GASOLINE from this 

CONVENIENT FOOD MART 

229 N. Second St 
OW.Y 1 COUPON W EACH PURCHASE 

PLUS A FREE 10' ICEE 
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ANOTHER U-SHOP FIRST 

THE ARE YQU EVEN SAFE 
WHEN SPIRO IS PUTTING 
U-SHOP OPEN 

FRIDAY  MAY 5th From Noon to 6:00 p.m. 

Pro 

T-Shirts 

-once again a day of goodtimes for all- an old 

Putting    Contest For Everyone Free U-Shop 

Given Away Free Give Away With Each Purchase 
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Chemistry Department 

Meets Student Needs 

Charlie Brown strikes out again and his 
teammates respond accordingly. Merle Mid- 
dleton (with bat) is Charlie Brown in the Eastern 
Kentucky University Players'production of the 
long-running musical, You're a Good Man, 
Charlie   Brown"   Giving   "what   for"   to   the 

Peanuts hero are, from left, Lisa Baldwin as the 
little readheaded girl; Mike Woods as Roy 
Patty; Cathy Hornsby as Sally Brown; Toni 
Trimble as Lucy Van Pelt ;Kathy Paris as 
Freida; H.R. Giles as Schroeder; and Dan 
Browning as Linus Van Pelt. 

Students planning to enter 
professions requiring a 
chemistry background but not 
planning to be research 
chemists are finding that the 
Eastern department of 
chemistry can meet their needs. 

One program leading to an 
A.B. degree at Eastern is 
designed for students who do 
not plan to enter research but 
might enter careers in en- 
vironmental improvement, law 
enforcement and criminology, 
chemical patent law, business 
(including management in the 

, chemical industry), and other 

Tnebasic chemistry degree 
at Eastern is the bachelor of 
scientist for students planning a 
career as professional 
chemists. A large percentage of 
those receiving this degree seek 
additional training in a 
research-oriented program 
leading to the master of science 
degree.   

News Briefs: 

White Elephant Sale Set April 29 
The Student Council For 

Exceptional Children will 
sponsor a White Elephant-sale 
April 29,1972 beginning at 9:00. 
The sale will be held on Main 
Street between Higgins Fur- 
niture Store and the Pet Shop in 
a vacant store. Members are 
going to collect, clean, price, 
and sell the merchandise. They 
would appreciate your support 
in providing any unneeded 
articles lying around your 
house. There will be three drop- 
off stations-the Kroger Store on 
Main Street, the A&P in the 
University Shopping Center, 
and the Student Association 
office in the Powell Student 
Center. You can deposit your 
items during store hours on 
Tuesday, April 25 through 
Friday, April 28. If you find it 
impossible to bring your items 
to any of these places, call 625- 
2566 and we will pick up 
anything you have. 

TKE Stick-On Day, Today 
The   Tau   Kappa   Epsilon 

Fraternity is sponsoring a stick- 
on day today from 2-5 p.m. Free 

Aurora 

The Aurora, Eastern's 
literary publication, is now on 
sale. Aurora consists of Ar- 
ticles, Powems and Stories 
written by EKU students. The 
staff, Estill Pollock, Betty Jo 
McKinney, Mattie Adams and 
Brenda Wheeler, say that 
copies can be bought in Room 
133, Wallace; from members of 
Sigma Tau Delta, and in the 
University Center. The price is 
fl. 

Narses Leagne 

Tom F. Connelly, coordinator 
of allied, health at Eastern, has 
been chosen president-elect of 
the Kentucky League for 
Nursing. 

He will assume the office of 
president in 1973. The League is 
an organization of nurses, other 
health professionals, and lay 
people interested in health-care 
and nursing education. 

»],    Dr.      James      DeBurger, 
sr associate professor of Sociology 

at University of   Louisville 
spoke to the Alpha Kappa Delta 

Registration For Free Prizes 

Savings of lA and more on Everything In The Store 

(We are sorry but U-Shop Student Charges cannot be used while we are on sakt)| 

„come in and ask us about the "View U".... 

EKU decals will be distributed   gnup lagt ^ght. He spoke on 
by the Weaver Bid. and behind Gerontology-Some 
Clay on Kit Carson. 

general comments and im- 
plications for the family". This 
meeting was attend by students, 
faculty and public. The Alpha 
Kappa Delta is the 
Sociological Honor Society 
and the local chapter known as 
'Gamma of Kentucky' is 
organized in Eastern Kentucky 
University campus since last 
faU. 

City Library 
The City Library request that 

all   EKU   students   who  have 
checked books out to return 
them by May 12th. 

Journalism 

Delta Iota Alpha Phi 
Gamma's Eastern Kentucky 
University chapter has an- 
nounced the election of officers 
for next academic year: 

President, Sue Mantell, New 
Carlisle, Ohio; vice president, 
Linda Mittel, Louisville; 
secretory, Betsy Hill, Corbin; 
treasurer, Jim Ross, Rich 
mond; hailiff, Marianne Rose, 
Lexington, and student council 
representative, Kathy Covelle, 
New Lexington, Ohio. 

Alpha   Phi   Gamma   is   an 
honorary   journalism   society. 

KEA 

212 WATER ST. PHONE 623-9674 
STORE HOURS:   MON-FRI     11:00 to 7:00    SAT 9:00 to 5:00 
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[Private Meeting and Dining Room Now Available! 
IMAfS AT THr II ami 

II sm-a a*. Mease* tare tet.raet 

Dial 623-2264 

Eastern By-Pass 

Dr. R. Dean Acker, director 
of institutional research and 
professor of education, has been 
chosen president-elect of the 
Department of Higher 
Education of the Kentucky 
Educational Association. 

Dr. Acker defeated Dr. Alfred 
Wiley of Kentucky State 
College. - The election was held 
at the recent meeting of the 
KEA at Louisville. 

As presidentelect, Dr. Acker 
is responsible for the public 
relations program of the KEA 
department. He will work 
closely with Department 
President Paul Street, 
University of Kentucky. 

Dr. Acker will assume the 
presidency of the department 
next spring. 

Geaaa Be A Hayride 

It's springtime and what 
better way to have fun than a 
hayride. The AKA's have one 
planned Friday. Those who 
want to attend and share the 
fun, meet at Telford Hall at 7 
p.m. For tickets, contact any 
AKA sorority member or call 
Gwen Riffe (4759). 

Marchers 
(Continued From Page One) 

tending the present policy to 
freshmen. 

Martin, however pointed out 
that the cost of supervising all 
the dorms would be too great 
unless aU women would be 
willing to pay the extra fee. 
Martin also stated reluctance to 
the open visitation. He stated 
that such a policy would in- 
terfere with the privacy of 
roommates. He said, "These 
are bedrooms and why is it that 
visitation is something you want 
to do in a bedroom?" 

Paul Lanter, sophomore from 
Williamstown student 
representative from Civil 
Liberties Union said, at a sleep- 
in in the ravine that a suit was 
being filed by the civil Liberties 
Union for sex descrimination. 
He also stated that the sleep-in 
was not supported by the 
Student Association or any of 
the officers He said, "This is 
strictly an impromptu event." 
He added "I told the students 
that we were adivsed to have no 
organized meeting in the 
ravine, but when I came out of 
the Powell Building there were 
about' 75 students marching 
around gathering others to 
come over here." 

During the sleep-in several 
security officers and a few state 
police patroled tha ravine. 
StudenU sere also told that they 
were committing civil 
disobedience. 

Dr. Harry M. Smiley, 
department chairman, said, 
"The EKU department is proud 
that its majors receiving the 
B.S. degree are accredited by 
the American Chemical 
Scoiety. This usually means a 
higher starting salary and 
better job opportunities." The 
accreditation was received last 
year. 

The research graduate 
students are engaged in a wide 
spectrum of activities In such 
specialties as Inorganic, 
analytical, organic, medicinal 
and physical chemistry. 
Research topics include the 
determination of stabilities of 
certain complexes and the 
synthesis of a variety of diverse 
chemicals including inorganic 
molecules, and new chemical 
intermediates. These programs 
have such an appeal that most 
undergraduates choose elective 
credits in this research. 

The EKU chemistry depart- 
ment has most of the modern 
instrumentation required by 
chemical investigation today, 
according to Dr. Smiley. He has 
informed smaller colleges in 
this area that do not have many 
of these instruments that 
Eastern will cooperate in in- 
troducing instrumentation to 
their students. 

The department will spend a 
significant amount of a $52,000 
federal grant to ensure that its 
introductory courses 
adequately prepare the student 
for advanced work. Dr. Smiley 
said. Innovations in first-year 
chemistry instruction, such as 
mini-computers, will be in- 
troduced into Eastern's 
program in trial classes, " so 
that this up-to-date department 
will stay up-to-date." Smiley 
said. 

Students 

Honored 
Sunday 

b 

(Continued From Page One) 

ber, Larry H. Stroud, Fern 
Creek; Cecilian Club Music 
Scholarship Award, Mary 
Burdette, Lexington; Delta 
OMmicron: Senior Pin, 
Rebecca Rue, Harrodsburg; 
Star of Delta Omicron, Marsha 
Riggle, Ashland; Dickey 
Chappelle Society of Theta 
Sigma Phi: Outstanding 
Journalism Student Awards, 
Patricia Ann Carr, William 
sburg; Sonja Foley, Columbia. 
Outstanding Student in 
Department of School and 
Public Health, Beverly Wind, 
Bellevue. 

Interfraternity Council: 
Interfraternity Council 
Academic Award Spring 1971, 
Theta Chi; FaU 1972, Theta Chi; 
Kappa Delta Pi: Florence B. 
Stratemeyer Award, Sharon 
Elizabeth Maupin, Lebanon; 
James Warren Roberts, 
Seymour, Ind.; Music 
Educators National Con- 
fernece: Senior Award, Stephen 
Johnson, Oberlin, Ohio; Phi 
Alpha Theta: Phi Alpha Theta 
Scholarship Award, Imogene 
Herald, Batavia, Ohio; Phi 
Kappa Phi: Phi Kappa Phi 
Scholarship Award, Verena 
Catron, Richmond, Kitty 
Dyehouse, Lancaster. - 

Phi Mu Appha: Phi Mu Alpha 
Sinfonia Award, Ken Henry, 
Winchester; Pan-Hellenic 
Council: Dean of women's 
Award-Academic, Spring lt71, 
Alpha Kappa Alpha; FaU 1972, 
Kappa Alpha Theta; Sigma XI: 
Excellence in Research Award, 
To Be Announced; Pre- 
Engineering ' Scholarship 
Award: Presented by the Allen 
Company of Winchester, 
Thomas G. Thompson; Wilson 
and Cora Bond Memorial 
Scholarship Award: Presented 
to an Outstanding Student from 
Gay County, Linda Noland, 
Manchester. 

LOVE 
Cosmetics 

ST0CKT0NATPHARMACY 
Main Street 

Km Made 
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* Womanpower' 

Eastern Professor Remembers First   'WACV 

Army Has Landed Photo by Donald Wallbaum 

It isn't a science fiction movie being shot on -— helicopter, one of three being used for flight 
location at Keene Hall. The giant bug that ap- instruction in Eastern's Military Science 
peara to be attacking the dormitory is an Army     Department. 

Nurses Banquet 

The EKU Nursing Association 
will have its spring banquet at 6 
p.m. tonight in the University 
Center cafeteria. 

Kappa Delta Tag 

Kappa   Delta  Tau  held  its 
annual Spring Banquet, Sun- 
day, April 23th, in the Powell 
University   Center.   Following 
dinner ,K T's and their parents 
listened to an interesting talk by 
Dr. Sudduth and the officers for 

T, the coming year were installed. 
Cave Club 

The Cave Club will have the 
last cave trip this Saturday. The 
location will be posted in Mr. 

cilSchultz's office in the Moore 
Building. 

Fabulous Fifties 
"The Baptist Student  Union 

will have its spring banquet, 
, entitled the "Fabulous Fifties" 
at 6:30 p.m. Monday, May 1, in 
the    University     cafeteria. 

BV MARL A SAMPLE 

Tickets are on sale from any 
BSU member for $1.50. 

Class ef "W 
Class elections will be held 

May 4th at 7 p.m. in Combs rm. 
322. 

Sigma Epsilon chapter of 
Sigma Tau Delta, National 
English Honor Society, met 
April 13th for the election of 
officers for the coming year. 

Law    Enforcement 
The Association of Law 

Enforcement held elections for 
officers Wednesday,' April 12th. 
The newly elected officers are: 
President: Steven E. Morrow, 
Vice President: David Austin. 

Wesley Foundation 
The Wesley Foundation's 

Spring Banquet is being held 
Thursday, May 4th at 6:30 in the 
Powell Building, Room A. The 
cost is $2.50 per person; the 
money should be turned in to 
Gene Strange before April 30th. 

Organiiations Editor 
Warehouse Dance 

There will be a warehouse 
dance held tonight from 6-12 at 
the Home Tobacco Warehouse 
on 3rd Street. Featuring The 
Exiles and two other bands, at 
the cost of $1 per person. 

EKU Tops 
Voting . 
Turnout 
Last week. Eastern made 

state-wide headlines concerning 
Student Government elections. 
More students voted at EKU 
than at any other state school, 
including UK. More than 58 
percent on-campus students 
voted. 

The entire N.O.W. party was 
elected. Following are the 
senators-at-large for next year: 

Joyce Albro, junior 
psychology major, 1641 votes; 
David Cecil, freshman law 
enforcement major, 1343 votes; 
Hubert Hagan, sophomore 
social work major, 1366 votes; 
Larry Hill, sophomore social 
work major, 1538 votes; Paul 
Lanter, sophomore political 
science major, 1405 votes. 

Julie Lippy, junior 
psychology major, 1362 votes; 
Rosetta Lucas, junior law en- 
forcement major, 1438 votes; 
Sally Reed, freshman 
elementary education major, 
1393 votes and Steve Rowland, 
sophomore political suence 
major, 1522 votes. 

BY JIM HOUSE 
News Editor 

•It was a beautiful place-red 
brick buildings, lots of elm 
trees-just beautiful!" 

A freshman describing firjg 
impressions of his college 
campus? Maybe a trip through 
a small New England town? No, 
ma'am. This is beautiful Fort 
Dea Moines , Iowa. 

That's hardly the kind of 
comment you'd hear from a raw 
army recruit even in today's 
"New Army." But if the recruit 
isa female, perhaps it's typical. 

Janet Oidham, an Assistant 
Professor of English at 
Eastern, remembers the old 
army and what it was like to be 
one of the first women to wear 
Uncle Sam's uniform. 

"In 1942 the army was short of 
manpower, so they started 
looking for womanpower," Mrs. 
Oidham said. "And this'was 
during a real war-declared by 
Congress." 

Congress Passed Act 
Congress passed an act in 

May of that year, establishing a 
Women's Auxiliary Army Corps 
(WAAC) and asked for 400 
women. 

"The army became deluged 
with applications," according to 
Mrs. Oidham, who said she was 
tired of "knittin' for Britain." 

From the thousands of ap- 

plications, the army chose 440 
women for the initial program, 
training the girls in Mess 
Management (what else?) and 
Map Reading, among other 
things. 

"We began with office jobs, 
but soon we were driving trucks 
and doing technical work,", 
Mrs. Oidham said. "I even had 
to instruct some of the girls on 
how to grease a truck in the 
motor pool." 

At Fort Des Moines, the first 
WAAC was trained exclusively 
by male officers in nearly the 
same way as a regular recruit, 
right down to the physical 
training. The training period 
lasted six weeks, after which 
most of the women were 
commissioned. 

Mrs. Oidham became a cadre 
for the second group of women 
to hit Des Moines and later 
became a company com- 
mander. 

"We got the same pay as male 
officers," Mrs. Oidham said. 
"And they even had to salute 
us." 

The girls were housed in a 
downtown hotel and Mrs. 
Oidham remembers close order 
drill (very close, in fact) in the 
hotel corridors. 

She was sent to Richmond the 
following year as a special 
services officer for a group of 

recruits housed in Eastern's 
Sullivan Hall. So the women in 
this fall's ROTC program will 
not be the first on campus. "My 
job was to see that the enlisted 
women got their mail and to 
find them entertainment in 
Richmond," she sighed. 

Mrs. Oidham remembers a 
total of about three men on the 
whole campus, so her job wasn't 

. made any easier. "We went to 
parties snd dances at Avon, 
(Lexington's branch of the Blue 
Grass Army Depot) and at 
Richmond's ordinance." 

She approached the president 
of the Madison Country Club 

.about the possibility of the girls 
being allowed to play golf there. 
They were denied, but were 
allowed the sue of the clubs 
brick fireplace for picnics and 
outings. 

Allowed To Play 

Mrs. Oidham, using her 
privileges as an officer, was 
allowed to play, however. 

The following year, the army, 
realizing that these girls were 
doing all right, changed the 
name to Women's Army Corps, 
and because the army does 
things that way, the women had 
to reenlist in order to become a 
Wac. 

By this time, however, Mrs. 
Oldham's interests were 
elsewhere, namely in the 
president of that country club, 
whom she married. 

She spent the next 15 years in 
Mess Management civilian 
style, and "was just a regular 
housewife," until she decided to 
give teaching a try. putting her 

Master's degree from the 
University of Illinois to good 
use. 

Mrs. Oidham said she did not. 
regret her choice to answer the 
problem of manpower shortage 
and, in fact, was glad she got 
her chace to enter into what she 
called "a new adventure, a new 
life,   and   a   new   world." 

MOVI1 

Regents'   Meeting 
(Continued From Page One) 

parental permission for  self- 
regulated hours.  Freshman 
women must live in dormitories 
with regulated hours. 

Women living under the self- 
regulated hours system pay an 
additional $15 per semester to 
finance the additional staffing 
necessary. No hours system is. 
in use for men's residence halls,. 

but if additional staff members 
were added for security prposes 
an additional fee, equal to that 
charged women, would be 
necessitated. 

The Board asked that a study 
of the self-regulated hours and 
open visitation be made by the 
University administration and 
that a report be submitted at a 
future meeting of the Board. 

KIPA Meets At Centre 
The Kentucky Intercollegiate 

Press Association held its an-' 
nual spring meeting last 
weekend in Danville on the 
Centre College campus. 
Highlighting the two-day affair 
were sneakers Lieutenant 
Governor Julian Carroll at 
Friday's luncheon and Walter 
"Dee" Huddleston, Democratic 
candidate for U.S. Senator at a 
Saturday panel discussion. 

Also included in the con- 
ference was election of officers 
for the 1972-73 school year. Two 
Eastern students, Jack Frost, a 
senior from Richmond, and 
Delma Francis, a freshman 
from Lancaster, were elected to 
serve as seond vice president 

and representative -a t-large.   , v 

The other officers of KIPA 
which were elected are Walter 
Warden, Berea College, 
president; Tom Chady, Murray, 
first vice president; Chela 
Richardson, Northern Ken- 
tucky University, recording 
secretary; and Harry Walker, 
Asbury, representative-at- 
large. 

Robert Adams, advisor for 
Western's College Heights 
Herald, was re-elected 
executive secretary of the 
conference. 

Over 60 delegates from twelve 
state colleges and universities 
attended KIPA. 

EXCESSIVE 
TIRE WEAR 

HARD 
STEERING 

WANDER 
OVER 50 YEARS 

EXPERIENCE 

Randall-Logsdon 
22* W. Irvine St. 

L   Phone S23-234S 
»  BEAR SYSTEM 

MOTION PICTURE 
ATTRACTIONS 

HIRAM BROCK 
_       AUDITORIUM 

•     *    •     •     . •     • 
April  27, 28 8. 29 

Th»ruUv   MM**   a   Saturday 
PLAY MISTY FOR ME 

(R) Suspense Drama 
Clint    Eastwood,    Jessica 
Walter,   Donna   Mills,    John 
larch 

•••••••• 
May 2—Tuesday 

PANIC IN  NEEDLE  PARK 
(R) Drama 

Al PaclRO, Kitty Wlnn, Alan 
Vint 
..A Raw and Un- 
compromising Examination 
of New York's Addicts and 
Pushers and Not-So- 
Sympathetic Police 
•   ••••• 

May    4,    5,   6 
Thursday,   Frldav. Saturday 
THE   VALLEY    OF    THE 
DOLLS (GP) 
Patty Duke, Sharon Tats, 
Susan Hayward, Loo Grant, 
Tonl Scotti, Barbara Perkins 
The dlslluslonments and 
pressure of success mat come 
to three girls In show 
business—a provocative film 
story.       

Stloctod Short Sublacts 
All   Programs 

Tkktt Office Open* 7 :M P.M. 
Show Starts 7:» P.M. 

Admission 7 5c 
- Children(Under ID sec 

I BUCCANEER I 
PfiK-IP Thwtrt— 

v ADULTS v 

A ONLV A 

Now 1 This Weekend 

Photo by Jim Stiaptierd 

Frances Adams smiles alter being selected as one of eleven 
winners in the Pi Kappa Alpha Calendar Oirl Beauty Pageant. 
Miss Adams was sleeted from 25 semifinals by faculty and 
administrative Judges. 

MAR-TAN 
OPTICAL 

INC. 
Latest Fashion 

Eyewmre 

Quality Rx Work 

233 W. MAIN 

623-4267 

CHECK THESE 

YOUR UNIVERSITY 
LAUNDRY & DRY 

CLEANING STATION 
623-6328 

rTROUSERS," 
| SKIRTS & 
j SWEATERS Mai 1 thru May 5 
i . . -<i • .—> 

■ 

' 

i_ —  

Sooooo convenient! 
Use our handy 

Drive-in window. 
If s great! 

| aTAftK-ntl K   RICHMOND 

SHIRTS 
LAUNDERED 

May 1 thru May 5 
I - • .  

Set sails in style nautical 

Sleeveless polyester  double  knit sailor dross, 

pleated skirt white with rod trim 

sues 5 to 13 

*22" 

-   -   ■ - --'- Baal 
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Kurk's 
orner 

BY JIM KURK 
Progress Sports Editor *4 
Retirees Remembered 

w-»x«%tt*:W:*^^ 

Bomb Louisville 10-0 

Colonels Sweep Wesleyan, Increase Win Streak 

As this school year comes to an end we want to 
recognize three long time members of Eastern's 
athletic staff who will be retiring at the end of this 
year, Coach Glenn Presnell, Coach Charles 
(Turkey) Hughes, and Miss Gertrude Hood. All of 
them have made invaluable contributions to 
Eastern's athletic program over the past years. 

Coach Presnell, who is still coaching the golf team 
this year, came to EKU in 1947 and was head 
football coach of the Colonels for ten years. During 
his years as football coach he won one OVC 
championship and shared another, and upon 
stepping down as football coach he began seven 
years of service as athletic director, a post he kept 
until stepping down this year. An athletic building 
expected to be finished in the near future will be 
named after him. 

Coach Hughes is recognized as the dean of OVC 
coaches, as he has been here since 1929. He is 
problably best known for his long service as 
Eastern's head baseball coach, a position he held 
until last year. His Colonel baseball clubs won ten 
OVC championships and the Colonels' home 
diamond, Turkey Hughes Field, is named after 
him. 

Coach Hughes has also coached football and 
basketball and served as EKU athletic director, 
and he also helped form the Ohio Valley Conference 
and served as its first president. 

Miss Hood, who's currently an associate 
professor of health, has been at EKU since 1928, 
and in her 44 years here she has taught in almost all 
fields of health and physical education for women. 
Hood Field, a women's intramural field, has been 
named after her. 

The sports staff of the Progress would like to 
thank them for all they've done for the Eastern 
athletic program. 

College Night May 5 
Friday night, May 5, will be College Night at 

Riverfront Stadium in Cincinnati when the Cin- 
cinnati Reds take on the defending world champion 
Pittsburgh Pirates. All college students will be able 
to get a reserved seat for $1.50. 

The EKU baseball Colonels 
improved their season record to 
an excellent 24-8 last Monday 
afternoon as they swept a 
doubleheader from Kentucky 
Wesleyan 1-0 and 7-3 at 
Owensboro. 

Billy Wells. Eastern's senior 
righthander, fired a four hit 
shutout in the first game, 
striking out one and walking 
only two. The vicotry raised 
Wells" record to a sparkling 7-1 
and lowered his team leading 
ERA to 1.35. 

Eastern managed only three 
hits in the opener, but they put 
two of them together in the 
second innins to produce the 
game's only run when right- 
fielder Larry Kaelin slammed a 
double and came home on 
center fielder Dave Theiler's 
single. 

Ashby. Blewitt Lead Attack 

Senior first baseman Buzz 
Ashby and senior third 
baseman Ken Blewitt led the 
EKU attack in the second game 
with two hits and two RBIs each 
as the Colonels put the game on 
ice early with a six run assault 
in the third inning. Sophomore 
lefty Ray Neumeister went all 
the way on the mound for 
Eastern, scattering eight hits, 
walking three, and striking out 
one to pick up his sixth victory 
of the year against two defeats. 

Last Thursday, early three 
run homers by catcher Roger 
Roberts   and   shortstop   John 

Ferrell powered the Colonels to 
a 10-0 destruction of the 
University of Louisville in a 
single game at Turkey Hughes 
Field. The early blasts gave the 
Colonels an insurmountable 7-0 
lead after three innings and 
enabled Neumeister to coast to 
the victory. A brilliant throw 
from left field by Rick Wirtz hi 
the ninth inning killed a bases 
loaded, no out threat by U of L 
and preserved Neumeister't 
shutout. 

Win Streak Now Five 

The three wins last week 
increased the Colonels' recent 
winning streak to five, and 
they've now won 16 out of their 
last 19 games. Third baseman 
Blewitt currently heads the 
Colonel batsmen with his .324 
average and 13 RBI's, and other 
top hitters have been Ashby 
(.320 average, two homers, M 
RBIs), Kaelin (.319 average, a 
team leading six homers and 22 
RBIs), Theiler (.311 average, 
tied with Kaelin for home run 
lead with six, 21 RBIs), Roberts 
(.255 average, three homers and 
a team leading 28 RBIs) and 
leftfidder Ray Spenilla (.29, 
average). 

Wells tops the Colonel pit- 
ching staff in just about every 
department, including wins 
(seven), ERA (1.36), innings 
pitched (53-3), games (19), and 
strikeouts (41). He is also tied 
with reliever Ernie Pennington 
for the most saves with four. 

EASTERN'S SENIOR CATCHER, ROGER ROBERTS, is rated 
as a top pro prospect by his coach, Jack Hisaom. The 
Wilmington, Ohio, native is regarded as the top defensive cat- 

HaveWon 16 of Last 19 

cher in the OVC and he also leads the Colonels in RBIs so far this 
season with 28. Roberto hit 296 last year and earned a spot on 
the All-OVC team. 

Defense And Speed Carry Baseballers 

Eastern Netters 
Belt Morehead 8-1 

Coach Jack Adams' Eastern 
tennis team easily defeated 
Morehead 8-1 Tuesday af- 
ternoon on the Alumni Coliseum 
courts. 

EKU swept the singles' 
matches en route to Its 11th win 
in 21 outings. Singles results 
were: Bruce Simms (E) def. 

"     0 — ■ ■ I 

END OF SCHOOL 
SALE vmmm 

Gary Lawrence (M), 6-4, 6-1; 
Greg Stephen son (E), def. 
Tracy Crew (M), 7-5, 6-3; Pat 
Geron (E), def. Craig Orr (M), 
6-2, 6-1; Paul Ballard (E) def. 
Bill Spell (M), 6-1, 64; Jim 
Greenup (E) def. Charlie 
Pierce (M), 6-3, 6-4; and John 
Young (E) def. Mike Purtz (M), 
M, 6-1.; >♦♦♦< 

As far as Eastern baseball is 
concerned defense and speed 
seem to be the name of the 
game. 

The EKU baseball team, 
under the direction of first-year 
coach Jack Hissom, has 
compiled a 24-84 record this 
season. .(Included in the overall 
mark is a 7-0 faU record. These 
games were played at home and 
return contests have been 
played this spring.) 

Since returning in mid-March 
from a southern road trip with a 
1-9-2 record, Eastern has won 14 
of its last 17 games with one tie. 
On that southern trip early last 
month, Eastern encountered 

^Jacksonville University, one of 

chara 

*»■" 

IN OUR TOP AND BOTTOM SHOP 
BUY ONE PAIR OF DOUBLE KNIT 
PANTS GET A MATCHING DRESS 

BODY SHIRT FOR 

•••• 

•••• 

ONLY'1.50 
VALUES UP TO912.00 

[RSDAY & FRIDAY ONLY 

SPANISH HUT 

The Colonels' doubles team of ' the top teams in the nation. The 
'Colonels lost the first game in 10 
innings 5-4 and the second 
contest 11-3. 

Eastern has been utilizing its 
speed and defense to the fullest 
since the first of April. For 
example, the EKU runners 
have stolen 60 bases this season 
in 75 attempts, an amazing theft 
percentage of .800. 

Stephenson , and Young was 
defeated by MSU's Orr and 
Spell, 6-4, 6-4. However, 
Eastern's other two doubles' 
squads were able to gain vic- 
tories. EKU's Geron-Ballard 
defeated Lawrence-Crew of 
Morehead, 6-4, 6-4, while 
Simms- Al Ramirez (E) 
defeated Pierce-Purtz (M), 6-2, 
6-3. 

In other matches held last 
week, EKU downed Middle 
Tennessee 5-4 and Western 
Michigan, 6-3, while losing to 
Austin Peay, 8-0. 

Eastern hosts Eastern 
Michigan this Sunday. 

24 Doable Plays 

In the field, the Colonels are 
also taking advantage of most 
every situation The infield 
combination of Ken Blewitt 
(3B), John Ferrell (SS), Donnie 

Williams (2B) and Buzz Ashby 
(IB) has turned over 24 double 
plays this season. As a team, 
EKU has a fielding average of 
.867. 

While sporting only a .241 
team batting average, Eastern 
seems to get the big hit when it 
needs it. Blewitt leads the 
Colonels with a .324 average. 
Outfielders Larry Kaelin and 
Dave Theiler have supplied the 
needed power with six home 
runs each. 

Roberts A Big Plui 

One of the big pluses for 
Eastern this season has been 
the receiving qf. catcher .Roger, 
Roberts, a senior'' from 
Wilmington, Ohio. Hissom is 
very high on Roberts and rates 
him as one of the top pro 
prospects on the team. 

"Roger is a strong, rangy, 
good defensive catcher with an 
excellent arm. And to top that, 
he has better than average 
speed. Why, for an example, 
Jacksonville, probably the 
toughest team on our schedule, 
is one of the top base-stealing 
teams in the nation. Yet, in our 
two games with them, 
Jacksonville didn't steal a base 
off Roger," Hissom said. 

Pitching has been a pleasant 
surprise   for   Eastern   this 

season, too. Billy Wells, a 
strong-armed righthander from 
Richmond, leads the pitching 
staff with a 7-1 record and four 
saves. His 1.35 E.R.A. is also 
tops on the team. 

Other Top Herlers 

Other top EKU pitchers and 
their records and earned run 
averages are: HowieRoesch, 4- 
2,2.61 E.R.A.; Ray Neumeister, 
6-2, 2.58 E.R.A.; and Craig 
Schleigh, 3-1, 3.81 E.R.A. 

Eastern has played a very 
tough, respectable schedule this 
season. Besides Jacksonville, 
the Colonels, bays encountered 

Cincinnati, Tennessee, Eastern 
Michigan, Louisville, plus Ohio 
Valley Conference schools 
Western Kentucky, Morehead 
State and East Tennessee. A 
four-game set with Ohio State 
was rained out and could not be 
rescheduled. 

Even though there will not be 
an OVC champion in baseball 
this season, the Colonels have 
compiled a 2-1 record against 
conference competition. 

Twin Bill Today 

Eastern     will 
doubleheader   with 
today at 1:30 p.m. 

host     a 
Morehead 

You buy the Chicken 

The Colonel buys 
the dessert 

I III    ^ i nun■ i i    I' 

MON-FRI 
SAT 10-6 P.M. 

FREE PARKING IN REAR 

1 FREE Pie with each Dinner Box 

! 3 FREE Pies with each Thrift Box 

|       5 FREE Pies with each Bucket or Barrel 

Every day this week the Colonel will treat you to^sert 
with any purchase of his. finger lockin' good Kentucky Fried 
Chicken. The more you buy, the sweeter the deal. 
Offer good thru May 4, 1972. 

Visit the Colonel 
COLONEL SANDERS1 RECIPE 

fcntiiikij fried Chkkm 

JACK BARBER ATTEMPTS to shoot out of the rough on the 
first tee during Eastern's match with Tennessee Tech here last 
Saturday. Barber helped (he Colonel golfers, who will host the 
Eastern Invitational tournament this weekend, to a 382-390 

"victory over Tech. 

** COUNTRYWIDE THEATRES, INC. 
TOVUfwE CINEMA 

1 

WEEKDAYS AT 7:45 
SAT 4 SUN AT 1:30-7:45 

PICTURES IS PROUD TO ANNOUNCE THE RETURN OF  .;- 
THE GntATf^ ramY ENTEfilJUNIiENT OF ALLTWE!   >■ 

® 

623-6000 
*—*- ; 

w-1'.iasiK* "i UN IMttO'. "M MJM MM 

HEST0N BRYNNER BAXTER ROWNSON DE CARLO PAGET DEREK 
». 
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■ m »■ .»*..»■'- 
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Following Victory Over Tech 

Golfers Host EKU Invitational Saturday 
Eastern's golf team will host 

the first annual Eastern Ken- 
tucky Invitational Golf Tour- 
nament this weekend at the 
Arlington Golf Course. 

Teams entered in the two- 
day,     36-hole     tournament 

scheduled to start Friday at 1 
p.m. include the University of 
Kentucky. Bellarmine. Ten- 
nessee Tech and Morehead. 

Coach Glenn PresneU's golf 
team raised its dual meet 
record to 7-1 last Saturday when 

it defeated Tennessee Tech at 
the Arlington Golf Course, 382- 
390. 

EKU senior Tim Brown of 
Louisville was medalist against 
Tennessee Tech with a 73. Roc 
Irey.  an  Eastern   sophomore 

from Pittsburgh, Pa., followed 
closely with a 74. 

Other Eastern scores wort: 
Jim Moore, Junior from Boron, 
77: Tom Scott, Junior from 
Richmond. Va., 71; and seniors 
Jack Barber and Billy Price, M. 

Holihan Named Most 
Valuable Swimmer 

EASTERN GOLFER JACK BARBER lines up a putt on the first 
hole in EKU's match with Tennessee Tech last Saturday af- 
ternoon at the Arlington Golf Course. The EKU golfers won the 

match 382-390 to improve their season record in dual matches to 
7-1. 

In Come-From-Behind Victory 

Track Squad Crushes Morehead, Tech 
Running an inspired meet, the 

underdog Eastern track team 
raised its dual meet record to 4- 
0 last weekend in an Ohio Valley 
Conference triangular meet at 
Morehead. 

Coach E.G. Plummer's EKU 
track team was able to ac- 
cumulate 74 points, compared 
to Tennessee Tech's 56 and 
Morehead's 52. 

"I would have to credit our 
tremendous team effort and 
attitude for our win last 
Saturday. They wanted this 
meet and there wasn't anything 
or anybody going to keep them 
from winning," Plummer said. 

EKU opened the meet with a 
win in the 440yd. relay, running 
its best time of the season (411) 
and getting close to the school 
record set last year at 41.8. 
Members of this relay squad 
were Bernie Hrubala, Gerry 
Scaringi, Tyrone Harbut, and 
Keith Bertrand. 

John Johnson, a senior from 
Louisville, and Hrubala kept 
EKU close to the leader, Ten- 
nessee Tech, by placing second 
and third in the ISO yd. high 
hurdles and 100 yd. dash, 
respectively. Johnson took 
second in the high hurdles with 
a time of 15.1 and Hrubala's 10.1 
in the 100 yd. dash was good 
enough for third place. 

Three Of Tea) Fear 

Eastern took three of the top 
four places in the 220 and the 440 
yd. dashes. Bertrand, a senior 
from Trinidad, won both dashes 
with times of 22.1 and 49.4. 

Two other outstanding In- 
dividual performances by EKU 
runners came in the three-mile 
run. Tom Findley, a sophomore 
from Columbus, Ohio, finished a 
close second to Morehead's Dan 
Price in a time of 14:27 .0, a drop 
of some thirty seconds from last 

week's meet against Cum- 
berland. 

EKU's Dan Maloney also 
came on strong and finished 
third with a 14:47 time, his 
personal best. 

After the three-mile run and 
with three events remaining, 
the score read: Tenn. Tech 53, 
Eastern 48, Morehead 42 The 
mile relay, pole vault and shot 
put had yet to be concluded. 

Eastern proceeded to win all 
three events. 

The EKU mile relay team of 
Bertrand, Harbut, Tom Cahill 
and Mervyn Lewis far J out- 
distanced second place TTU 
with its 3:15.4 time. Tech 
finished at 3:28.1. EKU's Ron 
Setter and Dan Watson placed 1- 
2 in the pole vault at 14*6". 
Setter won the event because he 
missed at that height fewer 
times. 

The come-from-behind win 
-«M linohjedjor. Eastern whan 

Art Taylor, a Junior from 
Portsmouth, Va., heaved the 
shot, 47'6V. 

Taylor also picked up 
unexpected points for the 
Colonels when he placed third in 
the discus with a heave of 151 
feet. Niels Fogt captured fourth 
in the discus for EKU with 150 
feet. 

EKU picked up big points in 
the long Jump and triple Jump. 
John Johnson, after finishing 
second in the half mile, finished 
third in the long Jump (20*3") 
and third in the triple Jump (39' 
•"). "H" Miller added valuable 
points by Jumping 40'1" and 
finishing second in the triple 
Jump. 

Miller and Steve Seiss came 
through with fine showings in 
the 440 yard intermediate 
hurdles, placing second and 
third, respectively, with per- 
sonal best times of 55.8 and 55.9. 

Plummer Lauds Desire 

"I Just can't say enough about 
the enthusiasm and desire 
shown by every squad member 
that led to our win over a very 
strong Tennessee Tech team," 
Plummer concluded. 

EKU will compete in the Penn 
Relays this weekend in 
Philadelphia, Pa., where it will 
concentrate on the sprint 
medley and mile relay teams. 
Eastern returns home May 6 to 
host an OVC triangular meet 
with Murray State and 
Morehead State. 

AL RAMIREZ. WHO COMPETES as the number 
six singles man on the EKU tennis team, com- 
bined with Bruce Simms for one of Eastern's 
doubles victories in their easy 8-1 win over 
Morehead here last  Tuesday.   Ramirez and 

Simms won their match over their Eagle op- 
ponents by scores of 8-2,8-3. The Colonel netters 
will host Eastern Michigan in a match this 
Sunday afternoon. 

T4M.LV- HO 
RESTAURANT 

DININO ROOM • CARRY our • CUM 
STOP IN AND TRY OUR BREAKFAST SPECIAL 

r———10LLY-H0 PLATTER—--—-I 
i ! 
■ 1/4 lb. fraud sirtoiiv frits, slaw •"«* 115* drink 
I 
I 4.25 value      ONLY  95$     With This Coupon     I 

i _ J 
■ASTERN BY-PASS 

623-92 It 
RICHMOND 

Eastern held its annual 
swimming banquet Thursday 
night with senior Ron Holihan 
receiving the Most Valuable 
Swimmer award. 

Holihan, a resident of 
Camillus, N.Y., was a four-year 
letterman for head coach 
Donald Combs in the breast- 
stroke. He was also cited for 
having qualified for the NCAA 
his freshman and sophomore 
year. 

Fellow senior Ken Walters of 
Clearwater, Fla., was recipient 
of the Most Improved diver 
award while freshman 
backstroke artist Wes Arnold of 
Kingsport, Tenn., won the Most 
Improved Swimmer trophy. 

Receiving the 110 per cent 

Golf, Baseball 

Banquet Scheduled 
A banquet honoring Eastern's 

baseball and golf teams will be 
held this Tuesday night in the 
Powell Building cafeteria at 
6:30 p.m. 

EKU baseball coach Jack 
Hissom and* Colonel golf coach 
Glenn PresneU will present the 
top athletes on each squad 
awards for outstanding play 
this past season. 

The EKU golfers currently 
stand 7-1 against dual meet 
competition, while the Eastern 
baseball team is 24-8. 

award was sophomore Bill 
Stapieton of Knoxville, Tenn. 

Five swimmers were cited for 
having attained a grade-point 
average of 3.1 or better for the 
preceding two semesters. 
Receiving scholar citations 
from EKU President Robert R. 
Martin were seniors Ken Klein, 
Bob Sandford, Bob Webeler, 
Charles Dorroh and Chris 
Webb. 

The EKU Eels finished the 
1971-72 season with an 8-2 
record and a tenth consecutive 
Kentucky Intercollegiate 
Swimming Championship. 

CORNER NORTH SECOND ft IRVINE ST. 
RICHMOND.  KENTUCKY 

Where You Got Quofity 
One-Hour Dry Cleaning And 

Three-Hour Shirt Service 
6 Days A Week 

COME ON DOWN TO ANDY 'S 
AND TRY OUR 

SUBMARINE SANDWICH 

95* 
ANDYS PIZZA PALACE 

110 South Second 
623-5400 

OPEN 4:00 PM TO 1:00 AM 

RICHMOND 
DRIVE-IN THEATRE 

4 MUM IW«I *n US. 15 
BOTH SM4 - Ph. OSS-I71S 

NOW ENDS SATURDAY 
ADM. *1.50 RATED OP 
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EKU Center Board Presents 

THE CONCERT SOUND 
•f 

HENRY MANCINI 
SPECIAL GUEST ARTISTS 

BELL0ND   and S0MERVILLE 

KftM MHLtt 
CELESTE fMMMA. 

"TWILIGHT PEOPLE" 

SUN MON TUE 

OMRLTOM 
H€STOM 
TH€ 
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MAY 1, 1972 
ALUMNI COLISEUM 8 P.M 

Full - Time EKU Students  '2.00 
All others and tickets at the door '5.00 

I 
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Dorm Fire Alarms 
Receive Inspection 

Eastern President Robert R. 
Martin said yesterday that he 
was informed by an aide of 
Governor Wendell H. Ford that 
an EKU student had drafted a 
letter to the governor con- 
cerning the alleged 
inoperability of fire alarm 
systems on the Eastern cam- 
pus. 

The student, Paul Lanter, 
who is a spokesman for 
Eastern's Civil Liberties Union, 
apparently sent copies of the 
letter to the EKU maintenance 
department and to the 
Louisville Courier-Journal 

A state fire marshall's 
representative was to have 
inspected they systems in Todd 
and Dupree Halls last Saturday 
afternoon, and Martin issued a 
statement to Buildings and 
Grounds to the effect that all 
systems must be checked and 
put in working order by the time 
the inspector arrived. 

At 11:00 a.m. all-the systems 
had been put in good working 
order by E.W. Chapman, 
Director of Buildings and 
Grounds, and a staff of elec- 
tricians. By 1:00 p.m., Chap 
man and Deputy Fire Marshall 
Faulkner found that nearly al 
of the systems had been 
tampered with since the initial 
inspection. 

The results of the inspection 
revealed that in Todd[Hall 

Floors 11, 10, 9, 8 vibrating 
mechanisms worked but 
plungers would not strike the 
bell. 

7th floor was okay. 
<th floor was okay after a bath 

towel was removed. 
5th floor the bell had been 

removed and could not be 
found. 

4th floor was okay. 
3rd floor operated properly 

after stuffed toilet paper was 
removed. 

2nd floor plunger had been 
removed. 

1st floor was okay. 
Dupree Hall: 
Uth floor waa okay. 
10th floor rang once and quit. 
9th, 8th, 7th, 0th, 5th, «h, 3rd 

floors were okay. 
2nd floor not audible, 

mechanism vibrated but did not 
strike gong. 

1st floor audible, but holding 
screw of bell in office had been 
removed. 

'Similar conditions existed in 
Commonwealth Hall two weeks 
prior to the inspection, and the 
systems were replaced at a cost 
of $31 each. 

Martin said yesterday that a 
$100 reward would be offered 
for information leading to the 
arrest and conviction of anyone 
tampering with any fire alarm 
system or turning in a false 
alarm. 
-Martin also stated that a 

careful log would be kept when 
any such instances occurred. 

Student Regent Election May 2 

..Tuesday May Z will be 
election day for the Student 
Regeat. The State Legislature 
has new give Student Regents 
voting privileges. The Student 
Regeat for next year wBI be 
able to vote on all proposals 
which come before tie Beard of 
Reseats. 
. Qualifications for the Student 

Regeat are: a 2.2 grade 
average, Kentucky resident and 
full time student, must be a 
second semester sophomore. 
Candidates for the election are 
Lee Edglagton, sophomore; 
J.C. Bowling. Joyce Albro, 
Junior, Larry Pennlngton, 
Sharon Crews, Junior; Larry 
Clevelaaad, Junior, Steve 
Rowland, lunlor 

Photo by Donald Wallbaum 

Collegiate PenUcle, Eastern's 
honorary group for senior 
women has selected members 
for the following year. 

Collegiate Pentacle is based 
on the ideals of scholarship, 
sincerity, sympathy, simplicity 
am* service. 

Members must have a 3.0 
accumulative standing and be 
voted on by the present 
members of the organisation. 

Service projects for the group 
this year have included 
distributing discount cards 
during registration to welcome 
Eastern students to the com- 
munity and a coke party for 
transfer students. 

They have also sold Valen- 
tine's Day candy, tool kits. 

The group has held a tea for 
residence personnel and 
prominent women on Eastern's 

campus and has worked ex- 
tensively with the Telford 
Community Center, collecting 
some 800 volumes for the 
beginning of a library and 
conducting a clothing drive to 
replenish the clothing bank at 
the Center. 

The new members were 
selected from all Junior girls on 
campus having a a 3.0 standing. 
These girls were invited to a 
mixer and those who did not 
attend were considered not 
interested. Fifty new members 
were selected from the group 
who did attend. 

The 1972-73 Collegiate Pen- 
tacle members are: 

Deborah Abbot, Yvonne 
Allen, Jayne Bangs, Jill Bar- 
then, Connie Bauhan, Dorothy 
Bayer, Judy Bennett, Kathy 
Brothers, Nancy Burch, 

Janet Burks, Pam CaldweU, 
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Releases Second Album 

Ensemble Gains Recognition 

DENNIS HARRIS, who will assume the duties of rehearsal of one of the cuts from "In The 
arranging and composing for the University' Beginning," the Ensemble's new double-disc 
Ensemble next year, directs the group in the      album, which was released this week.  

For Next Year 

Collegiate Pentacle Selects Members 
Norma Clemmons, Sharon 
Crews, Sandra Croley, Darla 
Donley, Patricia Hicks, 
Patricia Floyd, Diana Hall, 

Edwina Hatcher, Carol Hir- 
zinger, Mary Hoagland, Mary 
Huber, Vicki Jansen, Vicki 
Jones, Margaret Kurapkat, Ann 
Mackin, Sharon Marlow,   , 

Marcie Marlow, Pauline 
McConathy, Vicki McDoanlad, 
Linda Mittel, Deborah Olds, 
Janna Partin Vice, Vickie 
Raderer, Cathy Rausch. 

Barbara   Redmon,   Wilma 
Rose, Maureen Sense!, Denise 
Smith,   Virginia   Stanfield, 
Marsha Sterchi, Roxie Stratton, 
SharonStroud.BettyMontgom 
ery. 

Priscilla   Thompson,   Gloria 
Van   Bever,   Gloria   Votaw, 
Donna Waugh, Brenda Wood, 
andMrs.Mabel Crisswell and Dr. 
Martha   Mullins,   Honoraries. 

BY JIM HOI SE    . 
- News Editor 

It hasn't been too long since 
no one knew about Eastern's 
University Ensemble. 

Now the 85-member group is 
releasing its second album. 
"In The Beginning," is now 
available to the public 

Their first offering, "We've 
Come This Far By Faith," sold 
more than 5,000 copies and from 
all indications, "In The 
Beginning" should do even 
better. 

Reggie Walters, an EKU 
senior and director of the group, 
who composed and arranged 18 
of the cuts on the new double 
album, spent two years coming 
up with most of the songs in the 
album. 

The rest of the songs are a 
mixture of traditional gospel 
and spiritual numbers done 
with the Ensemble's unique 
blend of Jazz and blues. 

Walters said he and the entire 
Ensemble were pleased with 
•he results of their work now 
being cut in Hollywood by 
Custom Fidelity Company. 

"It's the first double-disc 
album of its kind In this part of 
the country as far as I know," 
said Walters. 

The group also signed a 
contract with Custom Fidelity 
for their third, album to be 
produced early next year. 

"We've Come Thia Far By 
Faith" launched the Ensemble 
into professional music and into 
the world of concert tours on 
college campuses. 

This year's tours will include 
stopovers in New York City and 
Wahington and the new album 
will already have hit the market 
in the two cities. 

According to Walters, "the 
Ensemble started the 
movement toward this kind of 
music on the college campus." 
Since then, similar groups have 
sprung up at the University of 
Kentucky, the University of 
Louisville, Morehead, and 
Cincinnati. 

Dennis Harris, a gifted 
pianist, has taken over most of 
the duties of accompanying the 
group since Walters has turned 
to the composing, arranging, 
and directing role. 

Phillip Brown, a senior, is this 
year's Ensemble President, but 
will step aside after graduation 
in favor of Rubel Chadwell, a 
freshman.. 

Perhaps the best-received cut 
from the first album, "You 
Must Be Born Again, one of 

those unlikely combinations of 
gospel-spiritual-blues-jazz ("If 
you can believe that," says 
Walters) will reappear on "to 
The Beginning." 

The big reason for a return 
engagement for the song is the 
way in which Eloiee McKitrick 
who graduated last vear. 
handles it. Miss McKitrkk's 
voice is nothing short of 
beautiful and the Ensemble 
compliments her perfectly, 
making sure nothing upstages 
the lead singer. t 

In fact, nothing in We've 
Come Thia Far..." is overdone 
an unexpected pleasure from a 
group with little previous 
professional experience. 

It is little wonder that the 
group will sound Just as 
professional in their second 
offering as their first, even with 
the loss of several members 
through graduation, because of 
the strict rules of auditioning 
and screening. 

A good singing voice does not 
automatically entitle . a 
newcomer to become a member 
of the Ensemble. There are 
autitions, with emphasis on 
voice range, and there are strict 
screenings, with the filling of 
particular vacancies kept in 
mind. Still, auditions are open 
to anyone on campus. __ 

Senate Holds Last Regular Meeting 
(Continued From Page One) 

ministrative action." Along 
with this the Senate supports 
that the ombudsman be ap- 
pointed to his position for more 
than one year. 

From a second Slade 
proposal, the Senate will send 
letters of appreciation to the 
vice-president of Student 
Afairs, the Dean of Women and 
the Dean of Men for their co- 
operation in the Dorm Services 
and Conditions Survey. 

The Room Application and 
Contract Changes Report from 
the Student Rights and 
Responsibilities Committee, 
headed by Paul Lanter, was 
aporoved by the Senate. 

Merle Middleton asked for 
and received $125 needed by the 
EKU Forensics Team to attend 
the National Forensics Tour- 
nament being held at Ohio 
Northern University May 5. 
Middleton stated that the team 
attempted to obtain the money 
through the Student Affairs 
Office but failed to do so. ♦ 

All funds not used or needed 
by the Student Association will 
be used for a scholarship fund to 
be given to deserving students 
next fall. 

The Senate endorses their 
actions in calling the strike 
Friday. 

Among  the   proposals   that 

failed were $450, in the amount 
of $10 each, to the members of 
the Symphony Orchestra for' 
playing at graduation, that any 
document signed by student 
government be brought before 
the Senate before signature is 
obtained and that the ravine be 
declared a free speech and 
assembly area. A motion to 
send letters to several Ky. area 
newspapers stating present 
conditions at Eastern was 
tabled. 

Any student having 
grievances over next fall's 
room assignment should go to 
Housing Wednesday, May 3Jp\ll 
problems will be worked out if 
possible. 

** 
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The "OLD Prospector" is Lost! 

His BAG of Gold is Books And He 
; 

Knows Where the Best "BANK" 

in TOWN is Located. 
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DANIEL BOONE 
••II 

Just Follow his Map And Bring 

Your Books for Instant CASH 

UNIVERSITY STORE 
X MARKS THE SPOT "We put money in circulation91 

RAVINE CASH on the Barrel HEAD" 
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